EXHIBIT “A” TO ORDINANCE NO. 1180
ADMINISTRATIVE PROVISIONS
150.001 ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

Pursuant to California Government Code §§ 50022.1 to 50022.8, the City adopts and
incorporates by reference Appendix Chapter 1 of the California Building Code, 2007
Edition (“CBC”), published by the California Building Standards Commission, 2525
Matomas Park Drive, Suite 130, Sacramento, CA 95833-2936.

§ 150.002 AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS. The CBC is amended,
added to, or deleted from, as set forth below:

(A)  Relocated structures. Section 102.7 is amended by adding the following:

102.7.1 Relocation Investigation and Building Permit required. It
is unlawful for any person to move or cause any building or structure to be
relocated within the area of the City without first obtaining a relocation permit
and a building permit from the Building Official.

102.7.2 Relocation Impractical. The Building Official cannot issue
a permit for any building or structure to be relocated where the building or
structure endangers the public health, life or safety, or is in violation of
pertinent laws or ordinances.

102.7.3 Appeal. Any person denied a permit for relocation of a
structure may appeal such decision to the appeals board of the City within
seven days of such denial.

102.7.4 Building Permit for Relocated Structures. A building
permit may be issued by the Building Official to the owners of the buildings
or structures to be located for a period not to exceed six months. The Building
Official may extend the permit for an additional period of up to six months.

102.7.5 Performance Bond. The owner of the building to be
relocated must submit a cash bond in an amount equal to the estimated cost of
the work to be performed as determined by the Building Official. The amount
and conditions of the bond must be memorialized in writing in a form
prescribed by the City. Upon written request a portion of the bond may be
released to the owner during the progress of the work, retaining so much
therefore as, in the discretion of the Building Official, must secure the City for
the performance of any work remaining.

Failure to complete all work described in the agreement within the time
prescribed therein constitutes a material breach thereof. The Building Official
may enforce the provisions of the agreement by an action in specific

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 1 of 39



performance or injunction to cause the structure to be completed or
demolished, by any other action at law or equity, by referral to the City
Attorney for institution of criminal proceedings, or issuance of a citation for
violation of this Title. The deposit required in this Section may be applied to
pay reasonable attorney’s fees incurred by the City and the balance thereof, if
any, must be applied in the manner directed by the court towards fulfillment
of the agreement.

(B) Annual Maintenance permit. Section 105.1.1 is added as follows:

The Building Official may, upon receipt of the required fee, authorize the
issuance of an annual maintenance permit to any qualified person, firm, or
corporation regularly engaged in the repair, replacement, alteration, or
maintenance of electrical, plumbing or mechanical systems regulated by this
code. The annual maintenance permit must cover maintenance work which is
performed on the premises of a person, firm or corporation and entitles the
holder to be issued permits for said work on a monthly basis in lieu of
obtaining individual permits before each installation or alteration of electrical
wiring, plumbing, or mechanical equipment.

The holder of an annual maintenance permit must report all work done
under the permit to the Building Official not more than fifteen (15) days
following the end of each calendar month, or other period established by the
Building Official. Each such report must be accompanied by the appropriate
fees as required by resolution of the City Council.

(C) Exempted Work. Section 105.2 is amended and the following provisions are
added respectively to read:

Building:

1. One-story detached accessory buildings not over 12 feet in height used
as tool and storage sheds, playhouses, gazebos and similar uses,
provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet and the
building has no plumbing, electrical or mechanical.

2. (a) Fences not over 6 feet high.
(b) Masonry and/or concrete walls not over 3 feet 6 inches high.

4. Retaining walls which are not over 3 feet in height from the top of the
footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or
impounding flammable liquids.

10. Deleted.

12. Awning supported by an exterior wall less than 3 Ib. Per square foot
when projecting not more than 54 square inches.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 2 of 39



14. Dish receivers, antennas and flagpoles (including supports):

Electrical

1.

10.

(a) Dish receivers 18 inches or less in diameter, or antennas, less
than 30 feet in height and connected to the roof or structure.

(b) Dish receivers 18 inches or less in diameter, or antennas, less
than 50 feet in height and connected to the ground.

(c) Flagpoles less than 15 feet connected to the roof or structure.
(d) Flagpoles less than 25 feet connected to the ground only
(e) Dish receivers 18 inches or less in diameter or dish receivers

less than 10 feet in height connected to the ground.

Portable motors or other portable appliances energized by
means of a cord or cable having an attachment plug end to be
connected to an approved receptacle when that cord or cable is
permitted by the Electrical Code.

Repair or replacement of fixed motors, transformers or fixed
approved appliances of the same type and rating in the same location.

Temporary decorative lighting.

Repair or replacement of current-carrying parts of any switch,
contactor or control device.

Reinstallation of attachment plug receptacles, but not the
outlets therefore.

Repair or replacement of any over current device of the
required capacity in the same location.

Repair or replacement of electrodes or transformers of the
same size and capacity for the signs or gas tube systems.

Taping joints.
Removal of electrical wiring.

Temporary wiring for experimental purposes in suitable
experimental laboratories.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 3 of 39



(D)

11.

12.

13.

14.

The wiring for temporary theater, motion picture or television
stage sets.

Electrical wiring, devices, appliances, apparatus or equipment
operating at less than 25 volts, and not capable of supplying more than
50 watts of energy.

Low-energy power, control and signal circuits of Class II and
Class III as defined in the electrical Code.

A permit is not required for the installation, alteration or repair
of electrical wiring, apparatus or equipment or the generation,
transmission, distribution or metering of electrical energy or in the
operation of signals or the transmission of intelligence by a public or
private utility in the exercise of its function as a serving utility.

Permits. Section 105.5 is modified by deleting section

105.5 and adding subsection 105.5.1, 105.5.2, and 105.5.3 to read as
follows:

105.5.1. Expiration. Every permit issued by the building official
will expire by limitation and become null and void if the work
authorized by such permit is not commenced, continued, or completed
as follows:

a) Work not commenced. If the work authorized
by the permit is not commenced within one (1) calendar year after the
building official issues the permit. Work is presumed to have
commenced if the permittee obtained a required inspection approval of
work authorized by the permit.

b) Work stopped. If the work authorized by the
permit commenced, but is subsequently stopped for a period of six (6)
consecutive calendar months. Work is presumed to be stopped if the
permittee has not obtained a required inspection approval of work
authorized by the permit within the preceding six (6) month period.

c) Completion of work. Work authorized by a
permit must be completed within three (3) calendar years from the date
the building official issues the permit.

Upon expiration of a permit, before work can be recommenced, a
renewal permit must be obtained as specified in Section 105.5.2

105.5.2. Renewal. An expired permit may be renewed as follows:

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 4 of 39



a) Work not commenced. When a
permit has expired because work
was not commenced within one
(1) year from the date of permit
issuance, a renewal permit may
be obtained provided:

. The plans for the proposed work are essentially the same as originally
approved and permitted.

. The expiration has not exceeded two (2) years from the original issuance
date;

. The same edition of the technical codes are in effect as used in the initial

plan approval, or the plans have been updated to comply with the codes
currently in effect;

. All city approvals required before the building official issued a permit,
including, without limitation, grading, zoning, fire code, water and sewer
connection, or other limitations customarily placed on such permits, are
currently valid at the time of issuance of the renewal permit.

The fee for a renewal permit will be one-half (12) the amount required
for a new permit.

b) Work stopped. When a permit
expires because work authorized
by the permit commenced but
subsequently stopped for a period
of six (6) months, a renewal
permit may be obtained
provided:

1. The plans for the proposed work are essentially the same as
originally approved and permitted;

2. The expiration did not exceed three (3) years from the date
the building official issued the original permit;

3. The same edition of the technical codes are in effect as
used in the initial plan approval, or the plans have been
updated to comply with the codes currently in effect;

4. All city approvals required before the building official
issued a permit, including, without limitation, grading,
zoning, fire code, water and sewer connection, or other
limitations customarily placed on such permits, are

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 5 of 39



currently valid at the time of issuance of the renewal
permit;

The fee for a renewal permit will be one-half (%2) the amount required
for a new permit, except where construction progressed and all
inspections were approved except for the final inspection, the fee for
the renewal permit will be one-quarter (%) the amount required for a
new permit.

¢) Work not completed within three
years. When a permit expires
because the work authorized by
the permit was not complete
within three (3) years from the
date the building official
originally issued the permit, a
renewal permit may not be issued
except upon action of the board
of appeals. The board of appeals
may grant up to one (1) year
additional time to complete the
work if it finds that:

The permittee diligently pursued completion of the work
authorized by the permit, but for good cause has not been
able to complete the work within the three (3) year
limitation;

The permittee is not in violation of the permit conditions,
the technical codes, or any city or state code applicable to
the construction project;

The remaining work can be completed reasonably within
the additional time allotted.

. All city approvals required before the building official
issued a permit, including, without limitation, grading,
zoning, fire code, water and sewer connection, or other
limitations customarily placed on such permits, are
currently valid at the time the building official issues a
renewal permit;

The fee for a renewal permit is one-half (%2) the amount required for a
new permit, except where construction progressed and all inspections
were approved except for the final inspection, the fee for the renewal
permit is one-quarter (%) the amount required for a new permit.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 6 of 39



105.5.3. Extension of an unexpired permit. The building official
may extend the time for action by a permittee to commence work, or
complete the work authorized by a permit within the three (3) year
limitation, for a period not exceeding six (6) months upon written
request by the permittee showing that circumstances, beyond the
control of the permittee prevented action from being taken. Not more
than one such extension may be granted. No extension may be granted
when work stopped and the permit is subject to expiration as described
above.

(E) Fees. Sections 108.2 the following provision is added to
read:

Section 108.2.1 Fees may be established by City Council
resolution.

(F) Investigative fees: work without a permit. Section 108.7 is
added as follows:

108.7 FEE. An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee,
must be collected whether or not a permit is then or
subsequently issued. The investigation fee must be
equal to the amount of the permit fee set forth in the Fee
Schedule as adopted by this jurisdiction. The payment
of such investigation fee does not exempt any person
from compliance with all other provisions of either this
code or the technical codes from any penalty prescribed
by law.

Q) Special processing fees. Section 108.4 is modified by
deleting Section 108.4 and adding Sections 108.4.1 and
108.4.2 to read as follows:

108.4.1SPECIAL PROCESSING. Whenever any work for which
a permit is required by this code has been commenced
without first obtaining a permit, a special processing review
must be made before a permit may be issued for such work.

108.4.2FEE. A special processing fee, in addition to the permit
and investigation fee, must be collected whether or not a
permit is then or subsequently issued. The processing fee
must be established by the Fee Schedule as adopted by this
jurisdiction. The payment of such processing fee does not
exempt any person from compliance with all other
provisions of either this code or the technical codes nor
from any penalty prescribed by law.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 7 of 39



H) Fire damage inspection. The following is added as Section
109.7:

Section 109.7: A fire damage inspection will be required after a
fire which caused building, plumbing, electrical, or mechanical
damage.

) Business license inspection. The following is added as
Section 109.8:

Section 109.8: A business license inspection is required before the
City issues a business license for a new business, relocated business,
or a change of ownership.

@) Special Inspection. The following is added as Section
109.9:

Section 109.9: When the building official determines to achieve
compliance with this code a special inspection or observation may be
required by the building official.

X) Board of Appeals. Section 112 is deleted and the following
sections are added:

112.1.General. The board of appeals is designated to hear and
decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations made
by the building official relative to the application and
interpretations of the technical code. The building official
will be an ex officio member and act as secretary to the
board but not have voting rights upon any matter before the
board. The board may adopt reasonable rules and
regulations for conducting its investigations and will render
all its decisions and findings on contested matters, in writing
to the building official, with a duplicate copy for any
appellant or contestant affected by such decision or finding,
and may recommend to the city council appropriate new
legislation.

112.2. Applicability to Codes. The appeals board will serve as the
appellate board or body whenever any of the codes adopted
by reference provides for same. The appeals board will also
act as the general appeals board for other city construction
related adopted regulations.

112.3.Hearing Process. Appeals to the board will be processed in
accordance with this Code and on application forms
provided by the building official. A fee established by city

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 8 of 39



council resolution will accompany an application for a
hearing before the board of appeals. The fee is refundable
should the appellant prevail in a decision by the board.
Copies of any rules and regulations adopted by the board
must be delivered to the building official, who will make
them freely accessible to the public. The board’s decision
constitutes the City’s final decision.

112.4 Limitations of Authority. The board of appeals has no
authority to interpret the administrative provisions of this code or to
waive requirements of this code or the technical codes.

L) Violations. Section 113 is amended by adding Section
113.5 to the following:

113.5. To the extent that any of the provisions adopted by
reference in this Title differ with those in Title I, the provisions of
Title I take precedent.

(M)  Notice of Noncompliance. Section 116 is added to read as follows:

116. Notice of Noncompliance. Whenever the building official
determines that work was done on, over, or in any property in the city
without the required permit, or has otherwise not been completed in
accordance with the requirements of this code, the building official may
record a Notice of Noncompliance for that property with the office of the
County Recorder and notify the owner of the property of such action. The
Notice of Noncompliance will describe the property, will set forth the
conditions violating this code, and will state that the property owner has
been so notified.

The Building Official must submit a Release of Noncompliance Notice to
the County Recorder when it is determined that the conditions violating
this code were corrected or removed. A fee as established by city council
resolution may be charged to the property owner for submitting a Release
of Noncompliance Notice.

(N)  Toilet facilities for workers. The following Section 117 is added:
117. Any person having charge of or causing work or projects to
be performed, which involves workers, must provide on the premises or
immediately adjacent thereto, sanitary toilet facilities as approved by the

Building Official.

§ 150.003 POSTING OF UNREINFORCED MASONRY BUILDINGS

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 9 of 39



1. All unreinforced masonry buildings must be posted with a sign
stating “This is an unreinforced masonry building. Unreinforced
masonry buildings may be unsafe in the event of a major
earthquake.” Signs must be permanent, contrasting, and placed in
a conspicuous place visible at each entrance to the building. Signs
must be printed in 30-point bold type or larger and must be 5 x 7”
or larger in size. Conspicuous place means any location within six
feet of an entrance door, not over six feet above the floor level,
having clear sight lines, and not obscured or obstructed by an open
door or by any other object.

ii. Exception: This section does not apply to unreinforced masonry
construction if the walls are non-load bearing with steel or concrete
frame.

CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE
§150.015 ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

Pursuant to California Government Code §§ 50022.1 to 50022.8, the City adopts and
incorporates by reference the California Building Code, 2007 Edition (“CBC”),
including Volumes I and II, published by the California Building Standards Commission,
2525 Matomas Park Drive, Suite 130, Sacramento, CA 95833-2936.

§ 150.016 AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS. After due
consideration, the City Council finds that as a result of existing local climatic, geological,
or topographical conditions that amendments, additions, and deletions to the CBC are
reasonably necessary to provide sufficient and effective levels of safety for the protection
of life, health and property. Therefore, the CBC is amended, added to, or deleted from,
as set forth below:

(C) Administrative. Appendix Chapter 1 of the CBC is set forth in this code
commencing at § 150.001.

(B) Suspended Ceilings. Section 1613.7 is added to read as follows:

1613.7 Suspended Ceilings. Minimum design and installation standards
for suspended ceilings must be determined in accordance with the
requirements of Chapter 25 of this Code and this subsection.

1613.7.1 Scope. This part contains special requirements for suspended
ceilings and lighting systems. Provisions of Section 13.5.6 of ASCE 7 must
apply except as modified herein.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 10 of 39



1613.7.2 General. The suspended ceilings and lighting systems are limited
to 6 feet (1828 mm) below the structural deck unless the lateral bracing is
designed by a licensed engineer or architect.

1613.7.3 Design and Installation Requirements.

1613.7.3.1 Bracing at Discontinuity. Positive bracing to the structure must
be provided at changes in the ceiling plane elevation or at discontinuities in
the ceiling grid system.

1613.7.3.2 Support for Appendages. Cable trays, electrical conduits and
piping must be independently supported and independently braced from the
structure.

1613.7.3.3 Sprinkler Heads. All sprinkler heads (drops) except fire-
resistance-rated floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies, must be designed to
allow for free movement of the sprinkler pipes with oversize rings, sleeves or
adaptors through the ceiling tile, in accordance with Section 13.5.6.2.2 (e) of
ASCE7.

Sprinkler heads penetrating fire-resistance-rated floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling
assemblies must comply with Section 712 of this Code.

1613.7.3.4 Perimeter Members. A minimum wall angle size of at least a
two inch (51 mm) horizontal leg must be used at perimeter walls and interior
full height partitions. The first ceiling tile must maintain 3/4 inch (19 mm)
clear from the finish wall surface. An equivalent alternative detail that will
provide sufficient movement due to anticipated lateral building displacement
may be used in lieu of the long leg angle subject to the approval of the
Building Official.

1613.7.4 Special Requirements for Means of Egress. Suspended ceiling
assemblies located along means of egress serving an occupant load of 30 or
more must comply with the following provisions.

1613.7.4.1 General. Ceiling suspension systems must be connected and
braced with vertical hangers attached directly to the structural deck along the
means of egress serving an occupant load of 30 or more and at lobbies
accessory to Group A Occupancies. Spacing of vertical hangers must not
exceed 2 feet (610 mm) on center along the entire length of the suspended
ceiling assembly located along the means of egress or at the lobby.

1613.7.4.2 Assembly Device. All lay-in panels must be secured to the
suspension ceiling assembly with two hold-down clips minimum for each tile
within a 4-foot (1219 mm) radius of the exit lights and exit signs.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 11 of 39



1613.7.4.3 Emergency Systems. Independent supports and braces must be
provided for light fixtures required for exit illumination. Power supply for exit
illumination must comply with the requirements of Section 1006.3 of this
Code.

1613.7.4.4 Supports for Appendage. Separate support from the structural
deck must be provided for all appendages such as light fixtures, air diffusers,
exit signs, and similar elements.

(C) Seismic Design Provisions for Hillside Buildings. Section 1613.8 1s added to
read as follows:

1613.8.1 Purpose. The purpose of this section is to establish minimum
regulations for the design and construction of new buildings and additions to
existing buildings when constructing such buildings on or into slopes steeper
than one unit vertical in three units horizontal (33.3%). These regulations
establish minimum standards for seismic force resistance to reduce the risk of
injury or loss of life in the event of earthquakes.

1613.8.2 Scope. The provisions of this section must apply to the design of
the lateral-force-resisting system for hillside buildings at and below the base
level diaphragm. The design of the lateral-force-resisting system above the
base level diaphragm must be in accordance with the provisions for seismic
and wind design as required elsewhere in this division.

EXCEPTION: Non-habitable accessory buildings and decks not
supporting or supported from the main building are exempt from these
regulations.

1613.8.3 Definitions. For the purposes of this section certain terms are
defined as follows:

BASE LEVEL DIAPHRAGM is the floor at, or closest to, the top of the
highest level of the foundation.

DIAPHRAGM ANCHORS are assemblies that connect a diaphragm to the
adjacent foundation at the uphill diaphragm edge.

DOWNHILL DIRECTION is the descending direction of the slope
approximately perpendicular to the slope contours.

FOUNDATION is concrete or masonry which supports a building, including
footings, stem walls, retaining walls, and grade beams.

FOUNDATION EXTENDING IN THE DOWNHILL DIRECTION is a
foundation running downhill and approximately perpendicular to the uphill
foundation.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 12 of 39



HILLSIDE BUILDING is any building or portion thereof constructed on or
into a slope steeper than one unit vertical in three units horizontal (33.3%). If
only a portion of the building is supported on or into the slope, these
regulations apply to the entire building.

PRIMARY ANCHORS are diaphragm anchors designed for and providing a
direct connection as described in Sections 1613.8.5 and 1613.8.7.3 between
the diaphragm and the uphill foundation.

SECONDARY ANCHORS are diaphragm anchors designed for and
providing a redundant diaphragm to foundation connection, as described in
Sections 1613.8.6 and 1613.8.7.4.

UPHILL DIAPHRAGM EDGE is the edge of the diaphragm adjacent and
closest to the highest ground level at the perimeter of the diaphragm.

UPHILL FOUNDATION is the foundation parallel and closest to the uphill
diaphragm edge.

1613.8.4 Analysis and Design.

1613.8.4.1 General. Every hillside building within the scope of this section
must be analyzed, designed, and constructed in accordance with the provisions
of this division. When the code-prescribed wind design produces greater
effects, the wind design must govern, but detailing requirements and
limitations prescribed in this and referenced sections must be followed.

1613.8.4.2 Base Level Diaphragm-Downhill Direction. The following
provisions must apply to the seismic analysis and design of the connections
for the base level diaphragm in the downhill direction.

1613.8.4.2.1 Base for Lateral Force Design Defined. For seismic forces
acting in the downhill direction, the base of the building is the floor at or
closest to the top of the highest level of the foundation.

1613.8.4.2.2 Base Shear. In developing the base shear for seismic design,
the response modification coefficient (R) must not exceed 4.5 for bearing wall
and building frame systems. The total base shear must include the forces
tributary to the base level diaphragm including forces from the base level
diaphragm.

1613.8.5 Base Shear Resistance-Primary Anchors.

1613.8.5.1 General. The base shear in the downhill direction must be
resisted through primary anchors from diaphragm struts provided in the base
level diaphragm to the foundation.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 13 of 39



1613.8.5.2 Location of Primary Anchors. A primary anchor and
diaphragm strut must be provided in line with each foundation extending in
the downhill direction. Primary anchors and diaphragm struts must also be
provided where interior vertical lateral-force-resisting elements occur above
and in contact with the base level diaphragm. The spacing of primary anchors
and diaphragm struts or collectors must in no case exceed 30 feet (9144 mm).

1613.8.5.3 Design of Primary Anchors and Diaphragm Struts. Primary
anchors and diaphragm struts must be designed in accordance with the
requirements of Section 1613.8.8.

1613.8.5.4 Limitations. The following lateral-force-resisting elements
must not be designed to resist seismic forces below the base level diaphragm
in the downbhill direction:

1. Wood structural panel wall sheathing,

N

Cement plaster and lath,
3. Gypsum wallboard, and
4. Tension only braced frames.

Braced frames designed in accordance with the requirements of Section
2205.2.2 may be used to transfer forces from the primary anchors and
diaphragm struts to the foundation provided lateral forces do not induce
flexural stresses in any member of the frame or in the diaphragm struts.
Deflections of frames must account for the variation in slope of diagonal
members when the frame is not rectangular.

1613.8.6. Base Shear Rcsistancé-Secondary Anchors.

1613.8.6.1 General. In addition to the primary anchors required by Section
1613.8.5, the base shear in the downhill direction must be resisted through
secondary anchors in the uphill foundation connected to diaphragm struts in
the base level diaphragm.

EXCEPTION: Secondary anchors are not required where foundations
extending in the downhill direction spaced at not more than 30 feet (9144
mm) on center extend up to and are directly connected to the base level
diaphragm for at least 70% of the diaphragm depth.

1613.8.6.2 Secondary Anchor Capacity and Spacing. Secondary anchors at
the base level diaphragm must be designed for a minimum force equal to the
base shear, including forces tributary to the base level diaphragm, but not less
than 600 pounds per lineal foot (8.76 kN/m). The secondary anchors must be

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 14 of 39



uniformly distributed along the uphill diaphragm edge and must be spaced a
maximum of four feet (1219 mm) on center.

1613.8.6.3 Design. Secondary anchors and diaphragm struts must be
designed in accordance with Section 1613.8.8.

1613.8.7 Diaphragms Below the Base Level-Downhill Direction. The
following provisions must apply to the lateral analysis and design of the
connections for all diaphragms below the base level diaphragm in the
downhill direction.

1613.8.7.1 Diaphragm Defined. Every floor level below the base level
diaphragm must be designed as a diaphragm.

1613.8.7.2 Design Force. Each diaphragm below the base level diaphragm
must be designed for all tributary loads at that level using a minimum seismic
force factor not less than the base shear coefficient.

1613.8.7.3 Design Force Resistance-Primary Anchors. The design force
described in Section 1613.8.7.2 must be resisted through primary anchors
from diaphragm struts provided in each diaphragm to the foundation. Primary
anchors must be provided and designed in accordance with the requirements
and limitations of Section 1613.8.5.

1613.8.7.4 Design Force Resistance-Secondary Anchors.

1613.8.7.4.1 General. In addition to the primary anchors required in
Section 1613.8.7.3, the design force in the downbhill direction must be resisted
through secondary anchors in the uphill foundation connected to diaphragm
struts in each diaphragm below the base level.

EXCEPTION: Secondary anchors are not required where foundations
extending in the downhill direction, spaced at not more than 30 feet (9144
mm) on center, extend up to and are directly connected to each diaphragm
below the base level for at least 70% of the diaphragm depth.

1613.8.7.4.2 Secondary Anchor Capacity. Secondary anchors at each
diaphragm below the base level diaphragm must be designed for a minimum
force equal to the design force but not less than 300 pounds per lineal foot
(4.38 kKN/m). The secondary anchors must be uniformly distributed along the
uphill diaphragm edge and must be spaced a maximum of four feet (1219
mm) on center.

1613.8.7.4.3 Design. Secondary anchors and diaphragm struts must be
designed in accordance with Section 1613.8.8.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 15 of 39



1613.8.8 Primary and Secondary Anchorage and Diaphragm Strut Design.
Primary and secondary anchors and diaphragm struts must be designed in
accordance with the following provisions:

1. Fasteners. All bolted fasteners used to develop connections to wood
members must be provided with square plate washers at all bolt heads and
nuts. Washers must be a minimum 3/16 inch (4.8 mm) thick and two inch
(51 mm) square for 1/2-inch (12.7 mm) diameter bolts, and 1/4-inch (6.4
mm) thick and 2-1/2-inch (64 mm) square for 5/8-inch (15.9 mm)
diameter or larger bolts. Nuts must be wrench tightened before covering.

2. Fastening. The diaphragm to foundation anchorage must not be
accomplished by the use of toenailing, nails subject to withdrawal, or
wood in cross-grain bending or cross-grain tension.

3. Size of Wood Members. Wood diaphragm struts collectors, and
other wood members connected to primary anchors must not be less than
three-inch (76 mm) nominal width. The effects of eccentricity on wood
members must be evaluated as required per Item 9.

4. Design. Primary and secondary anchorage, including diaphragm
struts, splices, and collectors must be designed for 125% of the tributary
force.

5. Allowable Stress Increase. The one-third allowable stress increase
permitted under Section 1605.3.2 must not be taken when the working
(allowable) stress design method is used.

6. Seismic Load Factor. The seismic load factor must be 1.7 for steel
and concrete anchorage when the strength design method is used.

7. Primary Anchors. The load path for primary anchors and
diaphragm struts must be fully developed into the diaphragm and into the
foundation. The foundation must be shown to be adequate to resist the
concentrated loads from the primary anchors.

8. Secondary Anchors. The load path for secondary anchors and
diaphragm struts must be fully developed in the diaphragm but need not be
developed beyond the connection to the foundation.

9. Symmetry. All lateral force foundation anchorage and diaphragm
strut connections must be symmetrical. Eccentric connections may be
permitted when demonstrated by calculation or tests that all components
of force have been provided for in the structural analysis or tests.

10. Wood Ledgers. Wood ledgers must not be used to resist cross-
grain bending or cross-grain tension.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 16 of 39



1613.8.9 Lateral-Force-Resisting Elements Normal to the Downhill
Direction.

1613.8.9.1 General. In the direction normal to the downhill direction,
lateral-force-resisting elements must be designed in accordance with the
requirements of this section.

1613.8.9.2 Base Shear. In developing the base shear for seismic design,
the response modification coefficient (R) must not exceed 4.5 for bearing wall
and building frame systems.

1613.8.9.3 Vertical Distribution of Seismic Forces. For seismic forces
acting normal to the downhill direction the distribution of seismic forces over
the height of the building using Section 12.8.3 of ASCE 7 must be determined
using the height measured from the top of the lowest level of the building
foundation.

1613.8.9.4 Drift Limitations. The story drift below the base level
diaphragm must not exceed 0.005 times the story height. The total drift from
the base level diaphragm to the top of the foundation must not exceed 3/4 inch
(19 mm). Where the story height or the height from the base level diaphragm
to the top of the foundation varies because of a stepped footing or story offset,
the height must be measured from the average height of the top of the
foundation. The story drift must not be reduced by the effect of horizontal
diaphragm stiffness.

Where code-prescribed wind forces govern the design of the lateral force
resisting system normal to the downhill direction, the drift limitation must be
0.0025 for the story drift and the total drift from the base level diaphragm to
the top of the foundation may exceed 3/4 inch (19 mm) when approved by the
‘Department. In no case, however, must the drift limitations for seismic forces

be exceeded. '

1613.8.9.5 Distribution of Lateral Forces.

1613.8.9.5.1 General. The design lateral force must be distributed to
lateral-force-resisting elements of varying heights in accordance with the
stiffness of each individual element.

1613.8.9.5.2 Wood Structural Panel Sheathed Walls. The stiffness of a
stepped wood structural panel shear wall may be determined by dividing the
wall into adjacent rectangular elements, subject to the same top of wall
deflection. Deflections of shear walls may be estimated by Section 2305.3.2.
Sheathing and fastening requirements for the stiffest section must be used for
the entire wall. Each section of wall must be anchored for shear and uplift at

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 17 of 39



each step. The minimum horizontal length of a step must be eight feet (2438
mm) and the maximum vertical height of a step must be two feet, eight inches
(813 mm).

1613.8.9.5.3 Reinforced Concrete or Masonry Shear Walls. Reinforced
concrete or masonry shear walls must have forces distributed in proportion to
the nigidity of each section of the wall.

1613.8.9.6 Limitations. The following lateral force-resisting-elements
must not be designed to resist lateral forces below the base level diaphragm in
the direction normal to the downhill direction:

1. Cement plaster and lath,
2. Gypsum wallboard, and
3. Tension-only braced frames.

Braced frames designed in accordance with the requirements of Chapter 22 of
this Code may be designed as lateral-force-resisting elements in the direction
normal to the downhill direction, provided lateral forces do not induce flexural
stresses in any member of the frame. Deflections of frames must account for
the variation in slope of diagonal members when the frame is not rectangular.

1613.8.10 Specific Design Provisions.

1613.8.10.1 Footings and Grade Beams. All footings and grade beams
must comply with the following:

1. Grade beams must extend at least 12 inches (305 mm) below the
lowest adjacent grade and provide a minimum 24-inch (610 mm) distance
horizontally from the bottom outside face of the grade beam to the face of
the descending slope.

2. Continuous footings must be reinforced with at least two No. 4
reinforcing bars at the top and two No. 4 reinforcing bars at the bottom.

3. All main footing and grade beam reinforcement steel must be bent
into the intersecting footing and fully developed around each corner and
intersection.

4. All concrete stem walls must extend from the foundation and
reinforced as required for concrete or masonry walls.

1613.8.10.2 Protection Against Decay and Termites. All wood to earth
separation must comply with the following:

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 18 of 39



1. Where a footing or grade beam extends across a descending slope,
the stem wall, grade beam, or footing must extend up to a minimum 18
inches (457 mm) above the highest adjacent grade.

EXCEPTION: At paved garage and doorway entrances to the building, the
stem wall need only extend to the finished concrete slab, provided the
wood framing is protected with a moisture proof barrier.

2. Wood ledgers supporting a vertical load of more than 100 pounds
per lineal foot (1.46 kN/m) and located within 48 inches (1219 mm) of
adjacent grade are prohibited. Galvanized steel ledgers and anchor bolts,
with or without wood nailers, or treated or decay resistant sill plates
supported on a concrete or masonry seat, may be used.

1613.8.10.3 Sill Plates. All sill plates and anchorage must comply with the
following:

1. All wood framed walls, including nonbearing walls, when resting
on a footing, foundation, or grade beam stem wall, must be supported on
wood sill plates bearing on a level surface.

2. Power-driven fasteners must not be used to anchor sill plates except
at interior nonbearing walls not designed as shear walls.

1613.8.10.4 Column Base Plate Anchorage. The base of isolated wood
posts (not framed into a stud wall) supporting a vertical load of 4000 pounds
(17.8 kN) or more and the base plate for a steel column must comply with the
following:

1. When the post or column is supported on a pedestal extending
above the top of a footing or grade beam, the pedestal must be designed
and reinforced as required for concrete or masonry columns. The pedestal
must be reinforced with a minimum of four No. 4 bars extending to the
bottom of the footing or grade beam. The top of exterior pedestals must be
sloped for positive drainage.

2. The base plate anchor bolts or the embedded portion of the post
base, and the vertical reinforcing bars for the pedestal, must be confined
with two No. 4 or three No. 3 ties within the top five inches (127 mm) of
the concrete or masonry pedestal. The base plate anchor bolts must be
embedded a minimum of 20 bolt diameters into the concrete or masonry
pedestal. The base plate anchor bolts and post bases must be galvanized
and each anchor bolt must have at least two galvanized nuts above the
base plate.

1613.8.10.5 Steel Beam to Column Supports. All steel beam to column
supports must be positively braced in each direction. Steel beams must have

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 19 of 39



stiffener plates installed on each side of the beam web at the column. The
stiffener plates must be welded to each beam flange and the beam web. Each
brace connection or structural member must consist of at least two 5/8 inch
(15.9 mm) diameter machine bolts.

(D) Sub-Diaphragm and Continuity Ties. Section 1614, 1614.1 and 1614.1.6 are
added to read as follows: .

1614.1 General. The text of ASCE 7 must be modified as indicated in this
Section.

1614.1.6 ASCE 7, 12.11.2.2.3. Modify ASCE 7 Section 12.11.2.3 to read
as follows:

12.11.2.2.3 Wood Diaphragms. In wood diaphragms, the continuous ties
must be in addition to the diaphragm sheathing. Anchorage must not be
accomplished by use of toe nails or nails subject to withdrawal nor must wood
ledgers or framing be used in cross-grain bending or cross-grain tension. The
diaphragm sheathing must not be considered effective as providing ties or
struts required by this section.

For wood diaphragms supporting concrete or masonry walls, wood
diaphragms must comply with the following:

1. The spacing of continuous ties must not exceed 40 feet. Added
chords of diaphragms may be used to form subdiaphragms to transmit the
anchorage forces to the main continuous crossties.

2. The maximum diaphragm shear used to determine the depth of the
subdiaphragm must not exceed 75% of the maximum diaphragm shear.

(E) Structural Building Separation. Section 1614, 1614.1 and 1614.1.7 is added
to read as follows:

1614.1 General. The text of ASCE 7 must be modified as indicated in this
Section.

1614.1.7 ASCE 7, Section 12.12.3. Replace ASCE 7 Section 12.12.3 as
follows:

12.12.3 Minimum Building Separation. All structures must be separated
from adjoining structures. Separations must allow for the maximum inelastic
response displacement (Ay). Ay must be determined at critical locations with
consideration for both translational and torsional displacements of the
structure as follows:

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 20 of 39



Ay =Cyo... (Equation 16-45)
where Omax is the calculated maximum displacement at Level x as define in

ASCE 7 Section 12.8.4.3.

Adjacent buildings on the same property must be separated by at least a
distance Ay, where

Avr = (A )+ (A ) (Bquation 16-46)

and Ay and Aumy are the maximum inelastic response displacements of the
adjacent buildings.

Where a structure adjoins a property line not common to a public way, the
structure must also be set back from the property line by at least the
displacement, Ay, of that structure.

Exception: Smaller separations or property line setbacks must be permitted
when justified by rational analyses

(F) Drainage. Section 1803.7 is added to read:

1803.7.1  General. Provisions must be made for the control and drainage
of surface water around buildings. Concentrated drainage such as rainwater
from gutters and downspouts, scuppers, and roof valleys must be diverted
away from building foundations by means of concrete splash blocks and/or
other approved non-erosive devices.

1803.7.2  Gutters and Downspouts. When buildings are located on
expansive soil having an expansion index greater than 50, gutters,
downspouts, piping, and/or other non-erosive devices must be provided to
collect and conduct rainwater to a street, storm drain, or other approved
watercourse or disposal area.

1803.7.3  Vapor Barrier. An approved vapor barrier must be installed
below slab floors of all residential occupancies in such a manner as to form an
effective barrier against the migration of moisture into the slab. When sheet
plastic material is employed for this purpose it must be not less than 6 mils
(-006 inch) in thickness. The installation of a vapor barrier must not impair
the effectiveness of required anchor bolts or other structural parts of a
building.

Foundations at the perimeter of the concrete floor slabs must form a
continuous moisture barrier of Portland cement concrete or solid grouted
masonry to the depths required by Table 1805.4.2.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 21 of 39



(G) Footing Supporting Walls of light-frame construction. Table 1805.4.2 is
deleted and new Table 1805.4.2 to read as follows:

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 22 of 39



Building Regulations

ZDV INIMOTIOA NO SBLONLOOY

DHYDIV IO LM pesR] %30 iE

pas g
“IpesB wandpe {01} QRIS Owit 9F “Bunooy
FEIMO) A0y oW 71 Y0, piEsieq gy
pawmaqje 9T JO Yulop
10U 2434 & 03 pasnbas wonoyg
Samsous fem yoea
wir o >0 b7 18 €2 »doy
10 %€ -
pas s
*apead waselpe {01) Quis onsy Log *3unouy
BIMa] MOJIQ oW ZI 120 .8y Ik 2avy £
pamojje «81 Jo \qdap
00U $I3g e 0 paanbas wonog
dampsIow Aem qaua
wraigdo 20 .7 1 €8 @doy
IO %C el
P L
*apead waaefpe
Ko O] ARG
$peo] ol 81 30 qdop ,”.H..u
s 105 ¥ 0} pasnbas
pasoge £13¢) WnsOpg Kem LA
waido P '0'0 ,9¢ &
300 %€ £2 0 “Kem yoe
0 L8 1 vy
Ao PIPURNINOIIY
5 X300 oy
$pRO| 10u])
38w Jop qupery o yday
10)f punnIn)y [T
PAMOUE S0 o Bupmsop
({2]

HIRRA0LU Y R
woors () suoepunoy
PIswYy (5) sqepe pas snonupue?)
Sapupy Saaed ‘sdunoog 0§ JuI
Ridig wo AIPU) SYOS Jo 14 1§ 4940 njuRy
Ny Nuyg Mo A W€

SYS N

(¢4 & 8 88 o1
8l FF 4 8 4] 3
7l 54 8 4} 9
” 74 ] 81 ol
81 1z 3 1 ]
2l 1T 9 E 41 1]
” " M 8t o
31 8 L [ ]
fA [4] 9 i 9
4 123 8 81 ol
g1 -1 L 1 3
a k4] 9 (4% 9
{oyduy
PRI YFMLL PHE PUBIS) Jo
Nejang fuinjoN wopg Yudag
8
waNIY Y 6 Pim
9 9 SEIURNRL
o pomey  sfupoug Joyoaq Jupoag wng
P YOS 40) ARpNapMD 4
g vy uv

HSHD swd AU PESIEY B YRS 2103 wupBpunCg

NOILOMMELSNOD dNVIL-IHOIT A0 STIVA DNLLIOddNS NOLLVANNOA
¢y S081 A1dV.L

N M JA BEL 2a0Qy

-

-~

0N) w0y K13p 020

wosundxy paga



6€ JO pz obeg
Umo - :ﬁ.: Uﬂgﬂﬂ.‘uﬂm

. "UOTEPUNOJ POYSIUL SY} SUIULISPUN JOU [[IM UOT}OIUUOS [BUL]
JeY} OS UOLEPUNOJ 51} PUOASq PUE 9AOQE PUSJXS JSNU PUE UOHadSUT UOLEPUNO) 210J2q Po[[E)SUI 5 JSIU SINPU0d 1N punoIsIopur) 7|

"PUI3 2y} Jopun payooy oq ISNUW SIeq FUIOIOJUIaI ASUWIIYD [EOTHO A ABM [OBS 19JU30 UO , 7] 18 sIeq ¢ "ON
By} $SI] J0U JO UNSISUOO pue SUIj00J Y} JO WI0HO] S} SAOGE € PIJRO0] PLIS [EJUOZLIOY B UM PIoIOJUISI 9q 1SN s3u1j00J ooefdaIr] 'I1

"qe[s . Suneoyy,, yuspuadapul Ue se poudisop ST J0O[F Sy USYM PIPITIO oq JSITU qe[s PUE U0 I0LIG)Xa U9MI9q STeq SUIDIOJUIal JUdg (]

"S3IMONIS AI0)S-92IY} 10 SAYIUI G| PUE SSIMIONLS A10JS-0M] PUE SUO JOF SSYIUL 7 | JO WNIIUTUI € oq
Jsnul Jnq P99)YdIE PISUIY] 10 JOAUITUS [EINJONYS 1O [IAI PaId)siSal £q SUOTBNOTES Jo [eprugns uodn PaONpaI 9q ABW SYIPIM Furjoo,y 6

"U31Sap SULISAUITUD Y)IM 9OUBPIOIIE
Ul P30IOJUISI 9q IS SPeI3 JUSOR(PE JS0MO] 31f) IA0]E SSIUD[IIY) WS)S S} SO ¢ JO JYSIOY B PI2oXa YOIyMm S[[esm Wo]S UOHEPUNo, °g

‘s3uruado 1oop o3ered je papraoid oq
ISNW Z'4°S08 1 SqEL Ul SUOHEPUNO SNONUNU0J JOJ PAJI0ads Se PodIOJUISI ‘BIIE [RUONS-SSOIO UI 7] X ] UBY) SSI] JoU Wweaq opeIs v </

T"S081 9Iqe Ul s3U00] 19)owiad 10§ payIoads se Pajonsuod pue pausIsap oq ISOUW S0UBUIPIO
SIY} UL 7408 T UOLI9S M Fulk[dwros 1s1ireq oIm)srowr AIUOSBUIL 1O 9)910U00 Jus[eAmnbs Io wa)sAs uoryepunoy Isjowruad snonunuoo e
Aq paso[oua jou are yorym s3unooy Ioueju] ‘s3urjooy Jousyur Jopun 1dedxs pausysiour-oxd 9q JOoU pPasu SIOO[J Pasiel Iopun sooeds [MeI) 9

*mod qe[s yoes Jo smoy 47
UIHIAM UOYe) 3q JSUUI $)S9], "PA[[E)SUL ST ISLLIeq Jodea & pue pamod ore s191d puB SUOLEPUNOJ [IJUN POUTEJUIBW 9 JSNUI JUSJUOD SINSION ¢

'S[[es U100J IOLIA)Xd oy} JO 308) JOLIS)XS SY} JO SIYOUI OAL} UTYIIM 0} SNULU0D PUE Yidop-pIul qe[s Je paoe|d o4 JST JUSWISOIOJUISI QB[S ¥

"w9)s oy} Jo doy apy
MO[3q £ Uet) $S3] Jou pue 3urj0oy ) JO WoY0q dY) JA0GE € Uey} $SI] Jou paoe]d oq JSTUW SUOHEPUNO] SNONUIJUOD IO JUSWIJIONUISY €

"BOIE UOTJEPUNOJ SY) SULISIUS UIOI] IojeM J0BJINS
JuaA1d 03 apeid Jusoelpe sA0qe sayouUl (9) XIS UBY) SSI] J0U SUIPUIIXS SGIND YI1m papraold 5q 1SN S3[0Y [MBIO SS9008 JOO[JIOPU[) °T

. "[10S QAISURAXA JO S}00JJ0 ISIOApE
oy} Jsurese sprengoJes juo[eAmba opraoid o) UMOYS oIk SOANBUIS)E Yons Usym [eI0JO Surpring oy £q psaoxdde 8q Aew Suruojsiow
-51d SpNJoUL J0U O YOIy SWI)SAS IO “9FeNULIYS pue sUoIsIedXs USASUN Aq PISNED SSANSIP [EINJONLS JIWI] SN} PUB UOTJONIISUOD

910J2q [10S Y3 JO UOISURAX3 WLIOJIUN PUE WNLIXEW JASTYOR 0 JOPIO UL 740 9[qe, Ul Pagoads sloym paxmbai st Suruojstowery |

SHLONILOOA




6€ JO gz =beg
28D - LY. ATATIUXH



(H) Out-of-Plane Deflection. Section 1908.1 is amended to read as shown below
and Section 1908.1.17 is added to read as follows:

1908.1 General. The text of ACI 318 must be modified as indicated in
Sections 1908.1.1 through 1908.1.17.

1908.1.17 ACI 318, Section 14.8. Modify ACI 318 Section 14.8.3 and
14.8.4 replacing equation (14-7), (14-8) and (14-9).

1. Modify equation (14-7) of ACI 318 Section 14.8.3 as follows:

L must be calculated by Equation (14-7), and M, must be obtained by
iteration of deflections.

E P h 2, 1,c3
I,=—"A4A +2—|d—-c)+~ -
i Ec[ ok Zd]( °) 3 (147)

and the value E/E; must not be taken less thaﬁ 6.

2. Modify ACI 318 Sec, 14.8.4 as follows:

14.8.4 — Maximum out-of-plane deflection, A;, due to service loads,
including PA effects, must not exceed 1./150.

If M,, maximum moment at mid-height of wall due to service lateral and
eccentric loads, including PA effects, exceed (2/3) M., As must be calculated by
Equation (14-8):

2 Ma _gMcr 2
A, =§Acr+ —2(An _EA”) (14-8)
M" _gMcr

If M, does not exceed (*/3) M., A must be calculated by Equation (14-9):

Ma
As = (M jAcr (14"9)

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 26 of 39



5M _I? 5M 17

cr ¢ n_c

" T 48E,I " 48EI,

(I) Wood Structural Panels. Sections 2306.3.1, 2306.4.1 and Table 2306.4.1 are
amended to read as follows:

2306.3.1 Wood structural panel diaphragms. Wood structural panel
diaphragms are permitted to resist horizontal forces using the allowable shear
capacities set forth in Table 2306.3.1 or 2306.3.2.

2306.4.1. Wood structural panel shear walls. The allowable shear capacities
for wood structural panel shear walls must be in accordance with Table
2306.4.1. These capacities are permitted to be increased 40 percent for wind
design. Wood shear walls must be constructed of wood structural panels
manufactured with exterior glue and not less than 4 feet by 8 feet (1219 mm by
2438 mm), except at boundaries and at changes in framing. Wood structural
panel thickness for shear walls must not be less than 3/8 inch thick and studs
must not be spaced at more than 16 inches on center.

The maximum allowable shear value for three-ply plywood resisting seismic forces
is 200 pounds per foot (2.92 kn/m). Nails must be placed not less than 1/2 inch
(12.7 mm) in from the panel edges and not less than 3/8 inch (9.5mm) from the
edge of the connecting members for shear greater than 350 pounds per foot
(5.11kN/m). Nails must be placed not less than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm) from panel edges
and not less than 1/4 inch (6.4 mm) from the edge of the connecting members for
shears of 350 pounds per foot (5.11kN/m) or less.

Any wood structural panel sheathing used for diaphragms and shear walls that are
part of the seismic-force-resisting system must be applied directly to framing
members.

Exception: Wood structural panel sheathing in a horizontal diaphragm is
permitted to be fastened over solid lumber planking or laminated decking,
provided the panel joints and lumber planking or laminated decking joints
do not coincide.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 27 of 39



Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 28 of 39



6€ JO 62 sbegq

UmU - t«ﬂ: UHQH.EU“W
(x0q paziueA[es — (x0q paziueAes
0¢L 0SS | 0P | 08T | WEI10X.%¢ Uowmiod mIOB 0SS | OSv | 08T | WEIT0X,%( uoumoo 8/ET TE/ST
W1E1 0X.74C) P8 i Z1€10%X,%4C) P8
ovy SPE | 09 | OL1 S8eD 9T ¢/1-1 W 6SC | S61 | 8TI 388D 91 ¢/1-1 T
(x0q pazrueAes = (x0q pazrueAes 91/L
20L9 pSOS | pS6€ | ,SST | WETT0X,%C uowuod Mlo pS0S | HS6E | ,SST | WETT0X,%( UOWIIOD 3/E 1
W1E1 0X,.%C) P8 ” W1€1 0%, %) P8
00¥ OT€ | SE€C | SSIT 33eD 91 ¢/1-1 %M 00Z | 9.1 | 911 388D 91 ¢/1-1 T
{(x0q paziueares o {x0q pazmueA[e3 8/€
019 09V | J09€ | ,0€C | WETTOX.%C UOWWIOd oz | 00C | 00T | 00T | WETT0X,ZC UOUIIOS g/c-1
«1€10%,%C) P8 5 ZIET0X,YC) P8
SIy GTE | S¥T | S91 38D 9T ¢/1-1 % 00Z | ¥81 | ¥21 988D 91 ¢/1-1 1
- (x0q 5 (X0q PoZIUEATes 91/S | SUMIEsys
01¢ 06€ | 00€ | 00T | PIZIUBATES 660 0X..C oz | 002 | 00T | OST | .660°0%.C OUIIOS -1 I
TWOUWWOD ,€T1°0X,.2) PO ZE110%X.2) P9 RIS
oC € v 9 ¥OZIS J[de;s o< € v 9 yOZIS J[de)s (satpur) H (you) aavao
: - NIIAVAA | SSAN | TANVd
Spwy | 1o oo breaes (Spu) wgps pued | - DA PEIRDE | roiy | SOmT
S35p9 [Pued )€ SUREdS Joud)Sey Hitos) TIVN je suneds Jaudjse J 10 TOWIH0) TIVN ALANAd | TANVd
ONIAVIA a v
OL X'TLOTIIA dAT' IddV STANVd ANALSVA | NTIAON
DONIAVIA OL A TLDAAIA AAT IddV STANVd SADAOI DIINSIAS I 178}
SEDUOS ANIM JOL ANTVA AVAHS A TaVAOTIV 404 ANTVA dVAHS ATaVAOTIV NWINTN | TAINIIAU

LYy £mVZ~Q< OTOISIAS 40 ANIM J04 ,ANId NUAHLN0S 40 HOuvV I-4ld SV 1910d 40 ONINV A
HLIM STIVA dVAHS TINVd TVINLONYLS AOOM 04 (LOOA ¥dd SANNOJ) dVAHS A T9VAOTIV
I'v°90¢C A1V .L

:SMOT[OJ SE PE1 0} PAPPE ST ['4°90€T OIqeL

"A[o11U S)1 UT PRl ST opo)) Bup[ing BIWIOFE) L00T 9Y1 JO ['4'90€T SIqeL,




6€ JO 0g 9beg

UmU - :ﬁ: uﬂgﬂﬂxm
0ty GEE | SST | OL1 938D 91 ¢/1-1 Nlmm IS | 161 | 8¢CI 338D 91 ¢/1-1 T
(xoq 5 (X0q poziueA[es
0LL ;009 | 09y | O1¢ PIZIUBA[ES ,,8TT°0X,,€ 77 ;009 | 09¥ | OI¢ w8C1°0X,,£ "Uouwod ¢o1-1 7ol
"uowod 8y 1°0X,£) POT w8Y1°0Xug) POT
(x0q pazrueA[es 5 (X0q pazrueA[es
0v9 06v | 08¢ | 09¢C wE11°0X,% ¢ "uowiod 79 06 | 08¢ | 09C | uETT'0X,%T UOWIWIOd 8/e-1
JIET°0X.%T) P8 _ W IET°0Xu%7) P8
S6¢ OI€ | 0€T | SSI 38D o1 ¢/1-1 m €T | LT | 911 338D 1 ¢/T-1 T
(X0q paziueATes — (X0q paziueA[es O1/L
pS8S pOSY | 0SE | [OPT | WETT 0X,%T UOWWOD m[m p0SY | ,0SE | OYCT | WwETT0XW%AT UOWIOD 8/e°1
W1E1°0X.%T) P8 | W I1ET°0X.%T) P8
09¢ 08¢ | OIT | ov1 38D o1 ¢/1-1 obm 00T | 8S1 | SOI 988D 91 ¢/1-T T
(x0q paziueAres o (X0q paziueA[es
p0ES p01IY | p0TE | ;0TT | WETT0X,%T "UOWWO) 07 00C | 00T | 00T | WEIT'0X,%C UOUIIOod 8/¢e-1 35
W IET°0X,%T) P8 W ITET°0X%T) P8
(xoq o (X0q pazueAres
0TS 06€ | 00¢ | 00T PaZIueA[es ,,660°0%.C 07 00C | 00T | 00T w660°0X,,C "UOW0)d Y/1-1
‘uourod , ¢11°0X.¢) PO wE1T°0X,C) P9 §3103dS
— n _ 4'
SLE S6C | 0CT | sP1 938D 91 ¢/1-1 % 00T | S91 | 601 338D 9T ¢/1-1 I mﬂ%
(xoq o (x0q paziueAes %M\wlm. ZOUIpIs
oSy 0Se | 0LT | 08I PIZIUBA[es ,,660°0%.C 07 00T | 00T | 08I w660°0X,,C 'UOWW0d v/1-1 / POOMATd
“uoumuod , e11°0X,2) P9 wE11°0X,C) P9 SuITesys
(xoq 5 (X0q paziueAes
0L8 5899 | 01S | OFE PIZIUBAeS ,8TT°0X, ¢ 73 5599 | OIS | Ov¢ «8C1°0X, € "UouIod 11
‘uowrwiod 8% 1°0X,€) POT _ u8Y1°0Xu€) POT
SLY SLE | 08C | S8I 388D 91 ¢/1-1 W I8C | 01T | 6¢l 388D 9T ¢/1-1 T




6€ JO Tg °@beg

UmU - td&ﬁ UHDr}n.E”unm
01y 01¢ W % (LETT0X.%T) P8 00Z | 00T | 00C | 09T (.EIT°0X,%27) PS 8/¢-1 8/€
09¢ 954 %M % (:660°0%.2) P9 00Z | 002 | 00z | OBT (.660°0%..2) PO VT OT/S
(Buises (Surses
PIZIUBATES) 9Z1S [TEN PAZTueATes) 9ZI§ [TeN
Sy GLE | 08T | <81 988D 0T $/¢-1 %m I8C | 01T | 651 388D O $/¢-1 T
(Xoq 5 (X0q paziueAes Te/6l
0L8 ;599 | OTS | OVE | DOZIUeATES 81 0X.E 78 ;599 | OIS | O¥E | .8TI0X,E UowWwiod 11
UOWI0d .81 0%,.£) PO1 WSYT0X,E) POT




Notes to Table 2306.4.1 _
For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, I foot = 25.4 mm, 1 pound per foot = 14.5939 N/m.
a.For framing of other species: (1) Find specific gravity for species of lumber in

AF&PA NDS. (2) For staples find shear value from table above for Structural
I panels (regardless of actual grade) and multiply value by 0.82 for species
with specific gravity of 0.42 or greater, or 0.65 for all other species. (3) For
nails find shear value from table above for nail size for actual grade and
multiply value by the following adjustment factor: Specific Gravity
Adjustment Factor = [1-(0.5-SG)], where SG = Specific Gravity of the
framing lumber. This adjustment factor must not be greater than 1.

b.Panel edges backed with 2-inch nominal or thicker framing. Install panels
either horizontally or vertically. Space fasteners maximum 6 inches on center
along intermediate framing members for 3/8-inch and 7/16-inch panels
installed on studs spaced 24 inches on center. For other conditions and panel
thickness, space fasteners maximum 12 inches on center on intermediate
supports.

c.3/8-inch panel thickness or siding with a span rating of 16 inches on center is
the minimum recommended where applied direct to framing as exterior
siding.

d.Except for wood structural panel sheathing used for shear walls that are part
of the seismic-force-resisting system, allowable shear values are permitted to
be increased to values shown for 15/32-inch sheathing with same nailing
provided (a) studs are spaced a maximum of 16 inches on center, or (b) panels
are applied with long dimension across studs.

e.Framing at adjoining panel edges must be 3 inches nominal or wider, and nails
must be staggered where nails are spaced 2 inches on center.

f. Framing at adjoining panel edges must be 3 inches nominal or wider, and nails
must be staggered where both of the following conditions are met: (1) 10d
(37x0.148”) nails having penetration into framing of more than 1-1/2 inches
and (2) nails are spaced 3 inches on center.

g.Values apply to all-veneer plywood. Thickness at point of fastening on panel edges governs

shear values.

h.Where panels applied on both faces of a wall and nail spacing is less than 6
inches o.c. on either side, panel joints must be offset to fall on different
framing members, or framing must be 3-inch nominal or thicker at adjoining
panel edges and nails on each side must be staggered.

1. In Seismic Design Category D, E or F, where shear design values exceed 350
pounds per linear foot, all framing members receiving edge nailing from
abutting panels must not be less than a single 3-inch nominal member, or two
2-inch nominal members fastened together in accordance with Section 2306.1
to transfer the design shear value between framing members. Wood structural
panel joint and sill plate nailing must be staggered in all cases. See Section
2305.3.11 for sill plate size and anchorage requirements.

j. Galvanized nails must be hot dipped or tumbled.

k.Staples must have a minimum crown width of 7/16 inch and must be installed
with their crowns parallel to the long dimension of the framing members.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 32 of 39



1. For shear loads of normal or permanent load duration as defined by the
AF&PA NDS, the values in the table above must be multiplied by 0.63 or
0.56, respectively.
m. [DSA-SS & OSHPD 1, 2 and 4] Refer to Section 2305.2.4.2, which requires
any wood structural panel sheathing used for diaphragms and shear walls that
are part of the seismic-force-resisting system to be applied directly to framing
members.
n. The maximum allowable shear value for three-ply plywood resisting seismic forces is 200
pounds per foot (2.92 kn/m). '

(J) Shear Walls Sheathing. Section 2306.4.5 to read as follows:

2306.4.5 Shear walls sheathed with other materials. Shear wall capacities for
walls sheathed with lath, plaster or gypsum board must be in accordance with
Table 2306.4.5. Shear walls sheathed with lath, plaster or gypsum board must
be constructed in accordance with Chapter 25 and Section 2306.4.5.1. Walls
resisting seismic loads must be subject to the limitations in Section 12.2.1 of
ASCE 7. The allowable shear values shown in Table 2306.4.5 for material in
Category 1 is limited to 90 pound per foot (1.31 kN/m); materials in Category 2
thru 4 are limited to 30 pound per foot (438 N/m). Shear walls sheathed with
lath, plaster or gypsum board must not be used below the top level in a multi-
level building.

(K) Conventional Light-Frame Construction. Section 2308.

2308.3.4. Braced wall line support. Braced wall lines must be supported by
continuous foundations.

2308.12.4. Braced Wall Line Sheathing. Braced wall lines must be braced
by one of the types of sheathing prescribed by Table 2308.12.4 as shown in
Figure 2308.9.3. The sum of lengths of braced wall panels at each braced wall
line must conform to Table 2308.12.4. Braced wall panels must be distributed
along the length of the braced wall line and start at no more than 8 feet (2438
mm) from each end of the braced wall line. Panel sheathing joints must occur
over studs or blocking. Sheathing must be fastened to studs, top and bottom
plates and at panel edges occurring over blocking. Wall framing to which
sheathing used for bracing is applied must be nominal 2 inch wide [actual 1'/,
inch (38 mm)] or larger members, spaced a maximum of 16 inches on center.
Nailing must be minimum 8d common placed 3/8 inches from panel edges and
spaced not more than 6 inches on center, and 12 inches on center along
intermediate framing members.

Braced wall panel construction types must not be mixed within a braced wall line. _

2308.12.5. Attachment of Sheathing. Fastening of braced wall panel
sheathing must not be less than that prescribed in Table 2308.12.4 of this division

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 33 of 39



or CBC Table 2304.9.1. Wall sheathing must not be attached to framing members
by adhesives.

All braced wall panels must extend to the roof sheathing and must be attached to
parallel roof rafters or the blocking above the braced wall panels with framing
clips (18 gauge minimum) spaced at maximum 24 inches (6096 mm) on center
with four 8d common nails per leg (total eight 84 common nails per clip).

TABLE 2308.12.4

WALL BRACING IN SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORIES D AND E

(Minimum Length of Wall Bracing per each 25 Linear Feet of Braced Wall Line®)

SHEATHING 0.50<Sps< | 0.75<Sps<

CONDITION | TYPE" Sps < 0.50 0.75 1.00 Sps > 1.00

GP° 10 feet 8 14 feet 8 18 feet 8 25 feet 0
One story £ inches inches inches inches

S-Ww ¢ > feet 4 8 feet 0 inches | 9 feet 4 inches 12 feet 0

inches inches

Story below GP° I5feelf NP NP NP
?‘;‘?gg)g gW &e 10 feet 8 13 feet 4 17 feet 4 2] feet 4

i inches” inches® inches® inches”
Bottom story G-P°
of three Conventional construction not permitted; conformance with
stories [HCD S-W Section 2301.2, item lor 2 is required.

1]

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

a. Minimum length of panel bracing of one face of the wall for S-W sheathing must be
at least 4°-0” long or both faces of the wall for G-P sheathing must be at least 8°-0”

long; h/w ratio must not exceed 2:1. For S-W panel bracing of the same material on
two faces of the wall, the minimum length is permitted to be one-half the tabulated
value but the h/w ratio must not exceed 2:1 and design for uplift is required.

b.G-P = gypsum board, and portland cement plaster or gypsum sheathing boards; S-W = wood
structural panels. NP = not permitted.

c.Nailing as spe01ﬁed below must occur at all panel edges at studs, at top and bottom plates and,

where occurring, at blocking:

For 1/2-inch gypsum board, 5d (0.113 inch diameter) cooler nails at 7 inches on center:
For 5/8-inch gypsum board, No. 11 gage (0.120 inch diameter) at 7 inches on center;

For gypsum sheathing board, 1 % inches long by 7/16-inch head, diamond point galvanized nails at 4

inches on center;

For gypsum lath, No. 13 gage (0.092 inch) by 1 18 Inches long, '9/64-inch head, plasterboard at 5

inches on center;

Exhibit

“A” - CBC

Page 34 of 39




For Portland cement plaster, No. 11 gage (0.120 inch) by 1 1/2 inches long, 7/16-inch head at 6
inches on center;

d.[HCD 1] Applies to detached one- and two - family dwellings only.
e.S-W sheathing must be 15/32” thick nailed with 8d nails, at 6:6:12.

f. For brace wall lines supporting only U occupancies, accessory to single family
dwellings, one of braced wall lines may have one panel constructed as follows per
each 12 linear feet of braced wall line. Each panel must have a length of not less than
2 feet 8 inches (813 mm) and a height of not more than 10 feet (3048 mm). Each
panel must be sheathed on one face with 15/32 inch thick plywood sheathing nailed
with 8d nails at 6:6:12 and blocked at all plywood edges. Two anchor bolts installed
in accordance with Section 2308.6 must be provided in each panel. Anchor bolts must
be placed at panel quarter points. Each panel end stud must have a tie-down device
fastened to the foundation, capable of providing an approved uplift capacity of not
less than 1,800 pounds (816.5 kg). The tie-down device must be installed in
accordance with the manufacturer's recommendations. The panels must be supported
directly on a foundation on a foundation which is continuous across the entire length
of the braced wall line. This foundation must be reinforced with not less than one No.
4 bar top and bottom.

(L) Anchorage. Section 2308.12.9 to read as follows:

2308.12.9 Steel bolts with minimum normal diameter of 5/8” spaced a
maximum of 4’ on center must be used in seismic design category E.

(M) Definitions. For the purposes of this chapter, the following definition applies
and is added to Section 3402.

Substantial Structural Damage. A condition where:

1. In any story, the vertical elements of the lateral-force-resisting
system, have suffered damage such that the lateral load-carrying capacity of
the structure in any direction has been reduced by more than 20 percent
from its pre-damaged condition, or

2. The capacity of any vertical gravity load-carrying component, or any
group of such components, that supports more than 30 percent of the total
area of the structure’s floor(s) and roof(s) has been reduced more than 20
percent from its pre-damaged condition, and the remaining capacity of such
affected elements with respect to all dead and live loads is less than 75
percent of that required by the building code for new buildings of similar
structure, purpose, and location.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 35 of 39



(N) Repairs. For the purposes of this chapter, the following repair requirements
are added as a new Subsection 3403.5 to Section 3403 Additions, Alterations or
Repair:

3403.5.1 Repairs. Repairs of structural elements must comply with this section.

3403.5.1.1 Seismic evaluation and design. Seismic evaluation and design of
an existing building and its components must be based on the following criteria.

3403.5.1.1.1 Evaluation and design procedures. The seismic evaluation and
design must be based on the procedures specified in the building code, ASCE
31 Seismic Evaluation of Existing Buildings (for evaluation only) or ASCE 41
Seismic Rehabilitation of Existing Buildings. The procedures contained in
Appendix A of the California Existing Building Code must be permitted to be
used as specified in Section 3403.5.1.1.3.

3403.5.1.1.2  CBC level seismic forces. When seismic forces are required
to meet the building code level, they must be one of the following:

a. 100 percent of the values in the building code. The R factor used
for analysis in accordance with Chapter 16 of the building code
must be the R factor specified for structural systems classified as
“Ordinary” unless it can be demonstrated that the structural
system satisfies the proportioning and detailing requirements for
systems classified as “Intermediate” or “Special”.

ii. Forces corresponding to BSE-1 and BSE-2 Earthquake Hazard
Levels defined in ASCE 41. Where ASCE 41 is used, the
corresponding performance levels must be those shown in Table
3403.5.1.1.2.

TABLE 3403.5.1.1.2
ASCE 41 and ASCE 31 PERFORMANCE LEVELS

OCCUPANCY | PERFORMANCE LEVEL FOR | PERFORMANCE LEVEL
CATEGORY | USE WITH ASCE 31 AND WITH | FOR USE WITH ASCE 41
(BASED ON | ASCE 41 BSE-1 EARTHQUAKE BSE-2 EARTHQUAKE
IBC TABLE HAZARD LEVEL HAZARD LEVEL

1604.5)
I Life Safety (LS) Collapse Prevention (CP)
1I Life Safety (LS) Collapse Prevention (CP)
I Note (a) Note (a)
v Immediate Occupancy (I0) Life Safety (LS)
1ii. Performance Levels for Occupancy Category III must be taken

as halfway between the performance levels specified for Occupancy Category II and
Occupancy Category IV.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 36 of 39



3403.5.1.1.3 Reduced CBC level seismic forces. When seismic forces are
permitted to meet reduced building code levels, they must be one of the

following:

1.

75 percent of the forces prescribed in the building code. The R
factor used for analysis in accordance with Chapter 16 of the
building code must be the R factor as specified in Section
3403.5.1.1.2.

In accordance with the applicable chapters in Appendix A of the
California Existing Building Code as specified in Items 2.1 through
2.5 below. Structures or portions of structures that comply with the
requirements of the applicable chapter in Appendix A must be
deemed to comply with the requirements for reduced building code
force levels.

2.1. The seismic evaluation and design of unreinforced masonry
bearing wall buildings in Occupancy Category I or II are
permitted to be based on the procedures specified in Appendix
Chapter Al.

2.2. Seismic evaluation and design of the wall anchorage system in
reinforced concrete and reinforced masonry wall buildings with
flexible diaphragms in Occupancy Category I or II are
permitted to be based on the procedures specified in Appendix
Chapter A2.

2.3. Seismic evaluation and design of cripple walls and sill plate
anchorage in residential buildings of light-frame wood
construction in Occupancy Category I or II are permitted to be
based on the procedures specified in Appendix Chapter A3.

2.4. Seismic evaluation and design of soft, weak, or open-front wall
conditions in multiunit residential buildings of wood
construction in Occupancy Category I or II are permitted to be
based on the procedures specified in Appendix Chapter A4.

2.5. Seismic evaluation and design of concrete buildings and
concrete with masonry infill buildings in all Occupancy
Categories are permitted to be based on the procedures
specified in Appendix Chapter AS.

In accordance with ASCE 31 based on the applicable performance

level as shown in Table 3403.5.1.1.2.

Those associated with the BSE-1 Earthquake Hazard Level defined

in ASCE 41 and the performance level as shown in Table

3403.5.1.1.2. Where ASCE 41 is used, the design spectral response

acceleration parameters S, and Sy; must not be taken less than 75

percent of the respective design spectral response acceleration

parameters Sps and Sp; defined by the California Building Code and
its reference standards.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 37 of 39



3403.5.1.2 Wind Design. Wind design of existing buildings must be
based on the procedures specified in the building code.

3403.5.2  Repairs to damaged buildings. Repairs to damaged buildings
must comply with this section.

3403.5.2.1 Unsafe conditions. Regardless of the extent of structural
damage, unsafe conditions must be eliminated.

3403.5.2.2 Substantial structural damage to vertical elements of the lateral-
force-resisting system. A building that has sustained substantial structural
damage to the vertical elements of its lateral-force-resisting system must be
evaluated and repaired in accordance with the applicable provisions of Section
3403.5.2.2.1 through 3403.5.2.2.3.

3403.5.2.2.1 Evaluation. The building must be evaluated by a registered
design professional, and the evaluation findings must be submitted to the code
official. The evaluation must establish whether the damaged building, if
repaired to its pre-damage state, would comply with the provisions of the
building code. Wind forces for this evaluation must be those prescribed in the
building code. Seismic forces for this evaluation are permitted to be the
reduced level seismic forces specified in Code Section 3403.5.1.1.3.

3403.5.2.2.2 Extent of repair for compliant buildings. If the evaluation
establishes compliance of the pre-damage building in accordance with Section
3403.5.2.2.1, then repairs must be permitted that restore the building to its pre-
damage state, using materials and strengths that existed before the damage.

3403.5.2.2.3 Extent of repair for non-compliant buildings. If the evaluation
does not establish compliance of the pre-damage building in accordance with
Section 3403.5.2.2.1, then the building must be rehabilitated to comply with
applicable provisions of the building code for load combinations including wind
or seismic forces. The wind design level for the repair must be as required by
the building code in effect at the time of original construction unless the damage
was caused wind, in which case the design level must be as required by the code
in effect at the time of original construction or as required by the building code,
whichever is greater. Seismic forces for this rehabilitation design must be those
required for the design of the pre-damaged building, but not less than the
reduced level seismic forces specified in Section 3403.5.1.1.3. New structural
members and connections required by this rehabilitation design must comply
with the detailing provisions of the building code for new buildings of similar
structure, purpose, and location.

3403.5.2.3 Substantial structural damage to vertical load-carrying
components. Vertical load-carrying components that have sustained substantial
structural damage must be rehabilitated to comply with the applicable

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 38 of 39



provisions for dead and live loads in the building code. Undamaged vertical
load-carrying components that receive dead or live loads from rehabilitated
rehabilitation design. New structural members and connections required by this
components must also be rehabilitated to carry the design loads of the
rehabilitation design must comply with the detailing provisions of the building
code for new buildings of similar structure, purpose, and location.

3403.5.2.3.1 Lateral force-resisting elements. Regardless of the level of
damage to vertical elements of the lateral force-resisting system, if substantial
structural damage to vertical load-carrying components was caused primarily by
wind or seismic effects, then the building must be evaluated in accordance with
Section 3403.5.2.2.1 and, if non-compliant, rehabilitated in accordance with
Section 3403.5.2.2.3.

3403.5.2.4 Less than substantial structural damage. For damage less than
substantial structural damage, repairs must be allowed that restore the building
to its pre-damage state, using materials and strengths that existed before the
damage. New structural members and connections used for this repair must
comply with the detailing provisions of the building code for new buildings of
similar structure, purpose, and location.

3403.5.3 Referenced Standards

Standard Referenced
Reference In Code
Number Title Section Number

ASCE 31-03  Seismic Evaluation of Existing Buildings  3403.5.1.1.1,
TABLE 3403.5.1.1.2,
3403.5.1.1.3

ASCE 41-06 Seismic Rehabilitation of Existing Building 3403.5.1.1.1,
3403.5.1.1.2,
TABLE 3403.5.1.1.2,
3403.5.1.1.3

(O) Appendix chapters. Appendix F, H, I, J are adopted as part of this code with
modifications as listed in this section.

(P) Design loads for patios. Section 1103 is to Appendix I:
Section 3120: Sections I 104 must only apply to lattice roof designs or solid

roof design of less than 3 Ib. Per square foot. Roof designs not meeting this
criteria must be designed to meet other applicable sections of this code.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 39 of 39



(Q) Powers and duties of the Building Official. Section J101.3 is added to read:

For the purposes of Appendix J, the City Engineer or Building Official is the
designated Building Official.

Exhibit “A” - CBC
Page 40 of 39



EXHIBIT “B” TO ORDINANCE NO. 1180
CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE
§ 150.025 ADOPTED BY REFERENCE.

Pursuant to California Government Code §§ 50022.1 to 50022.8, the City adopts and
incorporates by reference the California Plumbing Code 2007 Edition (“CPC”), and Appendices
A, B. D, [, and K, promulgated and published by the California Building Standards Commission,
2525 Matomas Park Drive, Suite 130, Sacramento, CA 93833-2936.

§ 150.026 AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS. After due consideration, the
City Council finds that as a result of existing local climatic, geological, or topographical
conditions that amendments, additions, and deletions to the CPC are reasonably necessary to
provide sufficient and effective levels of safety for the protection of life, health and property.
Therefore, the CPC is amended, added to, or deleted from, as set forth below:

Administrative. CPC Appendix Chapter 1 is deleted.
(A) PEX. Section 604.11.3 is added to read:

Cross-linked polyethylene (PEX) tub installation is limited to single
family detached with written request of property owner and installed
in compliance with manufacture listing.

(B) Materials. Sections 701.1.2.3,903.1.2.4, 1101.3.2, and 1102.1.3 are
added to read:

ABS and PVC installations fully enclosed are limited to commercial
and industrial buildings. Not more than one story in height of type
VB wood frame construction fully fire sprinklered, except below
grade concrete slab construction when approved by the Building
Official.

Exhibit “B” - CPC
Page 1 of 1



EXHIBIT “C” TO ORDINANCE NO. 1180
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
§ 150.035 ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

Pursuant to California Government Code §§ 50022.1 to 50022.8, the City adopts and
incorporates by reference the California Fire Code 2007 Edition (“CFC”) promulgated and
published by the California Building Standards Commission, 2525 Matomas Park Drive, Suite
130, Sacramento, CA 93833-2936.

§ 150.036 AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS. After due consideration,
the City Council finds that as a result of existing local climatic, geological, or topographical
conditions that amendments, additions, and deletions to the CFC are reasonably necessary to
provide sufficient and effective levels of safety for the protection of life, health and property.
Therefore, the CFC is amended, added to, or deleted from, as set forth below:

(A) Premises Indentification. Section 505.1 is amended and the
following provisions are added respectively to read:

505.1 Premises Identification. Approved address numbers and
letters must be placed on all new and existing buildings and units in
such a location as to be plainly visible and legible from the street or
road fronting such building and units. Numbers and letters must be a
minimum of 4 inches for residential, 6 inches in height for
commercial, and 12 inches in height for industrial buildings and
units and cannot be located on doors or other areas that will be
obstructed from view. The numbers and letters must be of a color
that contrast with their background and must be in the approved city
numbering sequence. Commercial and Industrial buildings and units
that are served by an alley must also have approved address numbers
and letters posted in a visible location near the primary door to the
alley

(B) Automatic Sprinkler Systems. Section 903.2 is amended and the
following provisions are added respectively to read:

903.2 Where required. An automatic Sprinkler system in new
buildings and structures must be provided in the locations described
in this section.

903.2.1 In all new occupancies, except detached Group U
occupancies less than 500 square feet.

903.2.2 In any existing building when any addition, or series of
additions, to that building, including but limited to lofts, mezzanines,

Exhibit “c” - CFC
Page 1 of 3



store rooms, or connected storage buildings increase the overall floor
area of the building by 500 square feet or more. In the case of any
existing single family residence, when addition or series of additions
increase the overall floor area of the residence by 1000 square feet or
more.

903.2.3 In any existing building before a change in its
occupancy classification to a group A, E, H, I, R1, R3, S1, S2, S3
occupancy from any other occupancy classification as determined by
current code definitions with respect to currently permitted and
proposed uses.

903.2.4 High-piled storage. An automatic sprinkler system must
be provided as required in Chapter 23 in all buildings of Group M
where storage of merchandise is in high piled or rack storage arrays.

903.2.5 Rubbish and linen chutes. An automatic sprinkler
system must be installed at the top of rubbish and linen chutes and in
their terminal rooms. Chutes extending through three or more floors
must have additional sprinkler heads installed within such chutes at
alternate floors. Chute sprinklers must be accessible for servicing.

(C) Roof Coverings. Section 705 is added as follows:

All new buildings must be constructed with Class A roof
coverings. When 50% or more of the roof of an existing building is
recovered, Class A roof covering must be used, except when the
existing roof support structure will not support the weight of a Class
A roof covering, Class B roof covering may be approved with the
consent of the Fire Official or Building Official. Notwithstanding the
forgoing, wood shake or wood shingles roof covering are prohibited.

(D) Appendix Chapters. Appendix Chapters 1, 4, B, C, D, and H are
adopted as part of this code with modifications as listed in this
section.

() Appendix Chapter 1, section 108 is deleted and the following
is added:

108 General. The board of appeals is designated to hear
and decide appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the fire official relative to the
application and interpretations of the technical code.
The fire official will be an ex officio member and act
as secretary to the board but not have voting rights
upon any matter before the board. The board may
adopt reasonable rules and regulations for conducting

Exhibit »C” - CFC
Page 2 of 3



its investigations and will render all its decisions and
findings on contested matters, in writing to the fire
official, with a duplicate copy for any appellant or
contestant affected by such decision or finding, and
may recommend to the city council appropriate new
legislation.

108.1 Applicability to Codes. The appeals board will serve
as the appellate board or body whenever any of the
codes adopted by reference provides for same. The
appeals board will also act as the general appeals
board for other city construction related adopted
regulations

108.2 Hearing Process. Appeals to the board will be
processed in accordance with this Code and on
application forms provided by the fire official. A
fee established by city council resolution will
accompany an application for a hearing before the
board of appeals. The fee is refundable should the
appellant prevail in a decision by the board. Copies
of any rules and regulations adopted by the board
must be delivered to the building official, who will
make them freely accessible to the public. The
board’s decision constitutes the City’s final
decision.

108.3 Limitations of Authority. The board of appeals has
no authority to interpret the administrative provisions
of this code or to waive requirements of this code or
the technical codes.

(ii) Violations. Section 109 is amended by adding Section 109.4
to the following:

109.4 To the extent that any of the provisions adopted by
reference in this Title differ with the provisions of
Title I of this code, Title I governs.

Exhibit “C” - CFC
Page 3 of 3



EXHIBIT “D” TO ORDINANCE NO. 1180
CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE
§ 150.045 ADOPTED BY REFERENCE.

Pursuant to California Government Code §§ 50022.1 to 50022.8, the City adopts and
incorporates by reference the California Electrical Code, 2007 Edition (“CEC”), promulgated
and published by the California Building Standards Commission, 2525 Matomas Park Drive,
Suite 130, Sacramento, CA 95833-2936.

§ 150.046 AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS.  After due
consideration, the City Council finds that as a result of existing local climatic, geological, or
topographical conditions that amendments, additions, and deletions to the CEC are reasonably
necessary to provide sufficient and effective levels of safety for the protection of life, health and
property. Therefore, the CEC is amended, added to, or deleted from, as set forth below:

(A) Conductors. The following is added to Section 110.5.1 to read:

ALUMINUM CONDUCTORS. Aluminum conductors used in
industrial applications under the provisions of this Code must be a
minimum of #6 A.W.G. stranded conductor.

(B) Electrode. Section 250.52 (A)(3) is deleted and new Section 250.52
(A)(3) is added to read:

Section 250.52(A)(3) Concrete-encased electrode. An electrode
encased by at least 2 inches (50.8 mm) of concrete, located within and
near the bottom of a concrete foundation or footing that is in direct
contact with the earth, consisting of at least 20 feet (6.1 m) of bare
cooper conductor not smaller than No. 4 A W. G.

Exhibit “D” - CEC
Page 1 of 1



EXHIBIT “E” TO ORDINANCE NO. 1180
CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE
§ 150.065 ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

Pursuant to California Government Code §§ 50022.1 to 50022.8, the City adopts and
incorporates by reference the California Mechanical Code 2007 Edition (“CMC”), including its
appendices A, B, C, and D, promulgated and published by the California Building Standards
Commission, 2525 Matomas Park Drive, Suite 130, Sacramento, CA 93833-2936.

§ 150.066 AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS. After due consideration, the
City Council finds that as a result of existing local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions
that amendments, additions, and deletions to the CMC are reasonably necessary to provide
sufficient and effective levels of safety for the protection of life, health and property. Therefore,
the CMC is amended, added to, or deleted from, as set forth below:

(A) Administration. CMC Appendix Chapter 1 is deleted.

(B) Hood and ventilation systems. Section 508.1 is deleted and new
Section 508.1 is added to read:

Section 508.1: Where required. Hoods and hood ventilation systems
must be installed to the satisfaction of the Building Official at or above all
commercial-type deep fat fryers, broilers, fry grills, steam-jacketed kettles,
hot top ranges, ovens, barbecues, rotisseries, dish washing machines and
similar equipment which produce comparable amounts of steam, smoke,
grease or heat in a food-processing establishment.

For the purpose of this section, a food-processing establishment shall
include any building or portion thereof used for the processing of food,
including dwelling units.

Exhibit “E” - CMC
Page 1 of 1



EXHIBIT “F” TO ORDINANCE NO. 1180
CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE
§ 150.085 ADOPTED BY REFERENCE
Pursuant to California Government Code §§ 50022.1 to 50022.8, the City
adopts and incorporates by reference the California Existing Building
Code 2006 Edition (“CEBC”), published by the California Standards
Commission, 2525 Matomas Park Drive, Suite 130, Sacramento, CA

95833-2936.

§ 150.086 AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS. The CEBC is amended,
added to, or deleted from as set forth below:

(A) Design. New Section A105.5 is added to Section A105 to read:

Section A105.5: For the purpose of this chapter, seismic zone
SD1 or greater is used.



EXHIBIT “G” TO ORDINANCE NO. 1180
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE
§ 150.150 ADOPTED BY REFERENCE

Pursuant to California Government Code §§ 50022.1 to 50022.8, the City
adopts and incorporates by reference the International Property
Maintenance Code 2006 Edition (“Maintenance Code”), published by the
International Code Council, Inc. 5203 Leesburg Pike, Suite 600, Falls
Church, Virginia 22041-3401.

§ 150.151 AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS AND DELETIONS. The Maintenance Code
1s amended, added to, or deleted from as set forth below:

(A) Section 103.5 is amended by adding the following:
103.5.1 The fees for activities and services performed by the
department in carrying out its responsibilities under this code
are established by city council resolution.

(B) Chapter 3 is amended by adding the following section:

309 Substandard Buildings. Any building or portion
thereof determined to be an unsafe building or any building or
portion, including any dwelling unit, guest room or suite of
rooms, or the premises on which the same is located, in which
there exists any of the conditions referenced in this section to
an extent that endangers the life, limb, health, property, safety
or welfare of the public or the occupants thereof, constitutes a
substandard building.

309.1 Inadequate Sanitation. Buildings or portions thereof
are substandard when they are insanitary. Inadequate
sanitation includes, without limitation, lack of water closet,
lavatory, bathtub or shower facilities and kitchen sink, lack of
hot and cold running water, lack of heating facilities, lack of
minimum amounts of natural light and ventilation, lack of
required room and space dimensions, lack of required electrical
lighting, dampness of habitable rooms, infestation of insects,
vermin or rodents, lack of connection to a sewage disposal
system and general dilapidation or improper maintenance.

309.2 Hazards. Buildings or portions thereof are
substandard when they are or contain structural hazards which
include deteriorated or inadequate foundations, flooring or
floor supports, walls or vertical supports that lean, list or



buckle, members of ceilings, roofs and roof supports or other
horizontal members that sag, split or buckle, any or all
deteriorated required electrical wiring system or service,
plumbing system including supply, drain, waste and vent
system or mechanical system that was installed in violation of
code requirements in effect at the time of installation or not
installed in accordance with generally accepted construction
practices in areas where no codes were in effect or that has not
been maintained in good condition. Fireplaces or chimneys
that list, bulge or settle due to defective material or
deterioration.

309.3 Hazardous or Insanitary Premises. The accumulation
of weeds, vegetation, junk, dead organic matter, debris,
garbage, offal, rat harborages, stagnant water, combustible
materials, and similar materials or conditions on a premises
constitutes fire, health or safety hazards that is substandard.

309.4 Improper Occupancy. All buildings or portions
thereof occupied for living, sleeping, cooking or dining
purposes that were not designed or intended to be used for such
occupancies are substandard.

(C) Section 404.4.1 Room area is amended to add the following.
404.4.1.2 Area for sleeping purposes. Every bedroom occupied by one person must

contain at least 70 square feet of floor area, and every bedroom occupied by more than
one person‘must contain at least 50 square feet of floor area for each occupant thereof.



